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Editorial

Can't we Kill pollution ?
Today in the name of

development that the
urbanization and
industrialization is taking place
hastily is a problem than
solution for human misery. It
echoes the grave concern of
each and every urban living
Indian. Unplanned and
haphazard urbanisation is the
root cause for all the pollution
related problems. The green
building movement is an
attempt to minimize and
eliminate negative impacts and
maximize environmental,
economic and community/
human benefits. Constructing
green buildings effectively
reduce air pollution through
reduced energy use, the use
of appropriate refrigerants,
and the use of materials with
low off-gassing and other
steps. The reduction in use of
fossil fuels at the building site
also results in lower air
pollution contributions at the
site, while reduction in
electricity use results in lower
air pollution associated with
power plants. It is clear that if
a builder is constructing a
green building, he can jump
the queue waiting for an
environmental clearance. The
release of gaseous pollutants
from burning fuel of motor
vehicles, industrial processes,
burning of garbage, etc are
contributing to the air pollution.

In its worst spell of
importunate pollution in nearly
two decades, the Capital's air
quality slipped into the
'hazardous' level. It reveals
that  the levels of air pollution
remained "severe", the highest
warning as per the National Air
Quality Index. India comes just
behind China - which
witnessed an estimated
800,000 deaths - says the
study, which relied on
mathematical modelling to
arrive at its figures. A number
of occupational and
environmental factors are also
associated with an increased
incidence of lung cancer.
Emergency measures have to
be put in place. People with
heart or lung diseases, older
adults, and children are to be
advised to remain indoors and

keep activity levels low.
Vehicle density is too much in
Delhi and the traffic jam is the
main culprit for the ambient
air quality deterioration.  It is
callous and irresponsible on
the part of the Delhi
government, which hasn't told
its people that the air quality
is so bad that they should not
step outside to exercise or
allow their children to play.
The air pollution is increasing
due to indiscriminate
industrialisation. As far as
addressing the issue of air
pollution is concerned, the
authorities are more at fault
for not devising and
implementing proper system
for disposing off the waste
generated. Every body has a
right to clean air. Planting trees
in every corner is essential to
improve the quality of the air.
The strategy should focus on
stop the pollution and improve
the quality of air.

It's not just the big cities
in India which are choking
children with its bad air.
Around the world, one billion
children live in homes where
solid fuel is used for cooking
and heating - a vital cause of
indoor pollution. Nearly 6
lakh children under the age
of five are estimated to die
every year from diseases
caused or exacerbated from
indoor and outdoor pollution.
Globally, an estimated 2,000
children under the age of five
die every day from diarrhoeal
diseases and of these some
1,800 deaths are linked to
water, sanitation and
hygiene. Children are also
exposed to harmful
chemicals through food,
water, air and products
around them. Air pollution
also increases the lifelong
risk of heart disease, stroke
and cancer. We need to make
people aware that their
activities should not release
more emission when our air
is already so polluted. It is to
be remembered that every
child is important. Every child
has the right to health, the
right to survive, the right to
a future that is as good as
we can make it.

There is no path to happiness;
happiness is the path

Vinod Chandrashekhar Dixit
Free-lance Journalist, Writer &

Cartoonist
(dixitpatrakar@yahoo.in)

Albert Camus a French
novelist has rightly said that
"You will never be happy if
you continue to search for
what happiness consists of.
You will never live if you are
looking for the meaning of
life".  The meaning of
happiness is contentment
and satisfaction. Finding true
happiness is a worthy goal.
Happiness is the thing that
most people want, yet it is
one of the most difficult
aspects of life to quantify.
How do we measure
happiness? How do we
define happiness? What is
happiness?  We can own a
luxurious life with all the
social needs but yet we may

be unhappy. There is a myth
that having lots of money can
make a person happy and
satisfy. What can provide
lasting happiness? Abraham
Lincoln once said 'You are as
happy as you make up your
mind to be.' Happiness is a
matter of choice. We can
make a choice to be either sad
or happy."  Happiness is
something which we can't
describe in words it can only
be felt from someone's
expression of a smile. Oxford
English Dictionary's definition
of "happiness" is a simple
one: "The state of being
happy."Likewise, happiness is
a signal or identification of
good and prosperous life.
Money can buy you food,
luxurious house, healthy
lifestyle servants, and many
more facilities but money can't
buy you happiness. The
International Day of Happiness
also recognizes the need for
a more inclusive, equitable
and balanced approach to
economic growth that
promotes sustainable
development, poverty
eradication, happiness and
the well-being of all peoples.
Every person defines

happiness in his/her own
manner but in whatever
manner one may define
happiness; the truth is that it
is vital for a healthy and
prosperous life. Happiness is
often derived from
channelizing thoughts to
positive thinking. In fact,
happiness does have a pretty
important role in our lives, and
it can have a huge impact on
the way we live our lives. For
one person happiness is
health, for another it is love
or spirit. Some people think
that happiness is only a short
time of their life. Today,
technological advancements
and development have made
our lives easier, comfortable
and more luxurious.

As we now know that we
can't buy happiness with
money and there is no other
shortcut to happiness. It is
something that you feel from
within. Everyone desires to be
happy in life. Unfortunately,
many people think they are
not happy, because they have
a lot of problems. Happiness
cannot be achieved without
establishing complete control
of one's thoughts as it is very
easy to be carried away by the

waves of thoughts and
emotions surrounding us.

In addit ion, true
happiness comes from
within yourself. Happiness is
basically a state of mind.
Though life throws countless
challenges at us on a daily
basis, if we drown in those
challenges we would
definitely become depressed
so let us find positive things
in our daily lives to get
excited about and feel the
happiness. Happiness
doesn't happen out of
anywhere - it has to be
worked on; it has to be
produced, created,
discovered, built from the
ground up. Happiness can be
by fulfilling relationship goals
and are respected by each
other. Happiness often
comes from within. What we
need is to learn how to tame
negative thoughts and
approach every day with
optimism. One must
remember that happiness
can happen to anyone,
mostly because everyone
deserves to be happy. (B-15
Jyoti-Kalash Society,
Jodhpur Tekra, Satellite,
Ahmedabad - 380 015)

Beyond Kerala's Thrissur Pooram

On April 30th, a flag went
up in the city of Thrissur, in
Kerala. This event – called
Kodiyettam is a traditional
f lag hoisting ceremony
conducted seven days before
the festival called Pooram
begins here. The Hindu
festival is the high point in the
socio-religious calendar of
Thrissur and witnesses the
coming together of numerous
other temple processions of
the city at one focal point -
the magnif icent
Vadakkumnathan Temple.

Its architecture, the
murals within and the legends
associated with it are each
worthy of a story of their
own. And unsurprisingly, the
Vadakkumnathan is one of
fourteen sites that Kerala has
recommended for UNESCO
World Heritage status. This
venerable shrine, a living
embodiment of ancient
traditions, witnesses lakhs of
people converging during the
Pooram, each participant or
visitor carrying home
memories of an unforgettable
public celebration of faith and
divinity. However, very few
people trace the traditions
back to their origins, or to
those who encouraged them.

While the original shrine
built at the site of the
Vadakkumnathan Temple is
said to be nearly sixteen
hundred years old, the
Pooram itself was the
brainchi ld of Sakthan
Thampuran, the ruler of
Cochin state at the beginning
of the 19th century. Visitors
can catch a gl impse of
Thampuran’s life and work at
the Vadakkechira Palace
nearby, which has a museum
named after him.

Rama Varma Kunji Pillai
Thampuran, to use Sakthan’s
real name, reigned in Cochin
for fourteen years beginning
1791. The largest temple
festival in this time was the
Pooram at Arattupuzha and
all the temples around
Thrissur participated in this.
On one occasion, the temples
around Thrissur were late in
joining the Arattupuzha event
and were denied
participation. This paved the
way for Thampuran to create
another Pooram at the
Vadakkumnathan Temple. A
60-acre teak forest around
the temple was cleared and

the vast park that exists
around the temple brought
into being. In the process,
Thrissur became a cultural
hub. The Vadakkechira Palace
was built by Thampuran in
1795 in a style that
incorporated elements from
Dutch architecture. After his
death in 1805, he was
cremated in the grounds of
the same palace – a small
memorial stands at the spot
today. Two centuries after his
death, the palace became a
museum. Not only is the
museum building an elegant
structure, but its galleries also
showcase Kerala’s dynamic
history since as early as the
5th century CE. Via coins,
inscriptions, sculpted remains
and more, the place gives a
visual commentary on the
various influences that
impacted the history of the
region. A serpent grove in the
palace grounds marks the

continuation of another
ancient Malayali tradition,
one normally associated with
temples. Close to this lies
another palace-turned-
museum. Kollengode was a
small kingdom in Palakkad
district, bordering what is
now Tamil Nadu. A
Kollengode ruler cal led
Vasudeva Raja built a summer
palace for his daughter in the
cultural hub of Kerala in 1904.
Another mix of Kerala and
European architecture, the
stately Kollengode Palace is
now Thrissur’s distr ict
museum. The first thing that
catches a visitor’s eye here
are the murals inside its
boundary wall – elaborate
recreations of Kerala’s
traditional painting styles
depicting various stories and
events from history and
mythology. On display within
the museum are models of
temple architecture as well as
various items used in folk
dances and other aspects of
popular culture, many of which
are seen in cultural processions
during the Pooram. Also seen
here are various household
items made of wood, metal and
even bamboo. The highlight of
the museum is its collection of
paintings, again featuring the
state’s rich culture.

Thrissur has a third
museum dedicated to history,
one that is sometimes
overlooked. Not because it lies

in some obscure place but
because it is within the zoo
complex. Apart from local
culture, this museum also

contains a display of the
region’s animal life. But its
standout feature is a stone in
its precincts – a memorial

stone erected over a century
ago, a stone that debunks the
‘martial race theory’ of the
British Indian Army.

The evil of banality
The philosopher Hannah

Arendt talks about the banality
of evil — a morbid social
syndrome where a society is
so habituated to evil that
common people, decent
human beings in constitution
and general conduct, accept
horrendous wrongs as normal
and unremarkable. Such,
according to Arendt, was the
mental state of the common
citizens of Nazi Germany. In our
own times, when more than
one nation or community faces
devastation in the full gaze of
an apathetic world, we should
seriously ask ourselves
whether we are so afflicted.

However, my subject today
is the opposite, where trivial
and inconsequential matters
receive disproportionate
attention, capture the public
imagination, and perhaps
cause substantial damage
while truly serious issues are
ignored. I am not talking of
matters intended as diversion
or entertainment, like sport or
cinema. The hype surrounding
popular sports and showbiz
may be excessive, arguably an
opiate of the people, distorting
social priorities. But they are
easily seen for what they are,
and the harm they might do is
offset by the skills they
incorporate, the social and
aesthetic values they foster,
and the relief they bring to the
tense lives of our citizens. That
is the purpose of sports and
entertainment.

What I have in mind is
something different, where
serious and often pernicious
implications are attached to
matters that by any balanced
assessment must count as
marginal, possibly long dead.
A quip by a stand-up comedian
or an indiscreet shot in a film
can ignite society — even
literally, leading to rioting and
arson if not murder. A casual
remark by a public figure is
twisted by a morbidly
motivated misreading into libel
or blasphemy. The relics of
rulers and warriors who died
centuries ago are redissected

to divide society. Lives have
been lost, and cities and
states thrown in turmoil, by
stoking controversy over the
grave of an emperor who died
over three centuries ago, or
the precise historical role of
another ruler and general a
century later. Every now and
then, fury erupts over alleged
slights to the memory of
equally remote figures or to
communities that hold them
in regard. History might be
rewritten in the process.

Needless to say, such
rewriting is generally devoid
of historical research, though
academic historians often join
the chorus. Many street-level
protesters might be hard put
to name the century when the
debated events took place.
The issues at work belong
entirely to the present, slaking
the thirst for power and
relevance of the faction
advancing it. Their cause is
tagged to a historical event or
a religious or patriotic
shibboleth to lend it credence,
or at least to make it
unpopular if not dangerous to
oppose it.

I recently watched the
news for fifteen minutes on a
national channel. The three
issues filling the time were:
first, a supposed insult offered
to a politician; second, a
confrontation between
vegetarian and non-
vegetarian neighbours in a
condominium; third, an
exchange of jibes among
national leaders on a matter
of undoubted moment but
without remotely touching on
its serious implications. The
news content was scarcely
more momentous than the
commercial breaks. Food is
now a matter of deep public
contention: even children are
conditioned not to share their
lunch boxes. What society will
these children build — or
dismantle – when they grow
up? Seeing as Vivekananda’s
name is routinely invoked in
contexts he would have
recoiled from.

Gujarat High Court upholds denial of conjugal
rights, cites wife’s suicide attempt, defamation
In a significant judgment,

the Gujarat High Court has
upheld lower court rulings
denying a woman's petition
for restitution of conjugal
rights, citing her attempted
suicide and public defamation
of her husband as grounds for
mental cruelty. Justice Sanjeev
Thaker, while dismissing the
wife’s appeal, observed that
the act of attempting suicide
during marital discord
amounted to “extremely
coercive behaviour” that
caused “emotional
manipulation and
psychological distress” to the
husband. Under Indian law,
restitution of conjugal rights
(Section 9, Hindu Marriage
Act) allows one spouse to
legally request the other to
resume cohabitation.

However, if the respondent
(in this case, the husband) can
prove cruelty, courts can deny
the petition. Mental cruelty
includes sustained emotional
or psychological abuse.

The court noted that the
woman had admitted to
attempting suicide and to
distributing defamatory
posters about her husband,
which the judge said
contributed to public
humiliation and sustained
emotional anxiety for the
spouse.

“In such cases, each
situation must be considered
in context,” the High Court
stated. “Marital relationships
require mutual respect and
compassion, especially during
conflict. In this case, the
husband’s refusal to resume
marital life was found to be
justified.”

The husband argued that
he lived in constant fear that
the events could recur, and
cited severe emotional
distress. The trial and
appellate courts had earlier
rejected the wife’s plea,
accepting the husband’s claims
of mental cruelty. The High
Court upheld these decisions.

Legal experts note that
restitution of conjugal rights —
a controversial provision
under Section 9 of the Hindu
Marriage Act — is increasingly
being contested on the
grounds of individual
autonomy and mental health,
especially in cases involving
coercive or high-conflict
marital situations.

This judgment reflects a
growing judicial emphasis on
mental well-being within
marriage, even as it raises
concerns about how the legal
system interprets acts of
distress — such as suicide
attempts — as coercion rather
than a cry for help.
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÷kufr{ºk, LOKMITRA

y{urhfk y™u [e™ ðå[u ÚkE xÙuz
ze÷, xurhV{kt 115% ½xkzku

ðku®þøxLk,
y{urhfk y™u [e™u

ŒksuŒh{kt yufƒeò …h ÷kËðk{kt

ykðu÷k ¼khu x urhV ½xkzðk™ku

r™ýoÞ ÷eÄku Au. ƒt™u Ëuþku ðå[u ƒu

rËð‚™e Wå[-MŒheÞ ðkxk½kxku

…Ae, yksu (‚ku{ðkhu) S™eðk{kt
yuf ‚tÞwõŒ r™ðuË™ ƒnkh …kzðk{kt
ykÔÞwt Au, su {wsƒ, y{urhfk y™u
[e™ 90 rËð‚ {kxu yufƒeò™k

Wí…kË™ku …h xurhV yMÚkkÞe Y…u
½xkzðk ‚t{Œ ÚkÞk Au. suÚke ðu…kh

Œýkð ykuAku ÚkE þfu y™u rðï™e

ƒu ‚kiÚke {kuxe yÚkoÔÞðMÚkkyku™u

Œu{™k {Œ¼uËku Wfu÷ðk {kxu ºký

{rn™k™ku ‚{Þ {¤e þfu.

‚ku{ðkhu ònuh fhkÞu÷k yuf

r™ðuË™ y™w‚kh, y{urhfkyu
{kuxk¼k„™e [e™e ykÞkŒ …h xurhV

yMÚkkÞe Y…u 145%Úke 115%
½xkze™u VõŒ 30% fÞkuo Au. yk{kt

VuLxk™kR÷ ‚tƒtrÄŒ Ëh™ku ‚{kðuþ

ÚkkÞ Au. [e™u y{urhf™ ‚k{k™ …h

125% xurhV 115% ½xkze™u 10%

fhðk …ý ‚t{rŒ yk…e Au. òufu,

yk ‚kuËk{kt ¾k‚ ðkŒ yu Au fu Œu

VõŒ 90 rËð‚ {kxu Au.

Þwyu‚ xÙuz rh«uÍLxurxð suB‚™
„úeh u sýkÔÞw t  nŒw t  f u y{urhfk
[kE™k™k {k÷ …h™k xurhV Ëh™u

145 xfkÚke ½xkze™u 30 xfk fhðk

{k™e „Þw t Au, ßÞkhu [kE™kyu
Þwyu‚ {k÷ …h™k Œu™k Ëh™u 10
xfk fhðk ‚t{Œ ÚkÞwt Au.

„úeh y™u Þwyu‚ xÙuÍhe ‚u¢uxhe
Mfkux ƒu‚Lxu S™eðk{kt yuf «u‚

fkuLVhL‚{kt xurhV ½xkzk™e ònuhkŒ

fhe nŒe. ƒt™u yrÄfkheykuyu

sýkÔÞwt nŒwt fu ƒt™u …ûkkuyu Œu{™k
xÙuz {wÆkyku …h [[ko [k÷w hk¾ðk
{kxu yuf hkuz{u… ŒiÞkh fÞkuo Au.

ƒu rËð‚™e ðkŒ[eŒ …Ae

yuf …ºkfkh …rh»kË{kt ƒku÷Œk,
ƒu‚Lxu sýkÔÞwt nŒwt fu Ÿ[k xurhV
MŒh™u fkhýu ƒt™u ƒkswÚke {k÷™ku
‚t…qýo ™kfkƒtÄe Úkþu y™u yk yuf
yuðwt …rhýk{ nŒwt, su ƒt™u …ûk
RåAŒk ™ nŒk. ƒu‚Lxu fÌkwt fu yk
‚ókn™k ytŒu ƒt™u

«rŒr™rÄ{tz¤ku™e ‚ðo‚t{rŒ yu Au

fu fkuE …ý …ûk y÷„ Úkðk {kt„Œku

™Úke. yk yíÞtŒ Ÿ[e

xurhV™kfkhýu... yuf rðûku… …zâku.

fkuE …ý …ûk yk RåAŒku ™Úke.

y{™u ÄtÄku òuEyu Au. y{u ðÄw
‚tŒwr÷Œ ðu…kh RåAeyu Aeyu. {™u
÷k„u Au fu ƒt™u …ûkku yk nkt‚÷ fhðk

{kxu «rŒƒØ Au.

„Þk {rn™u y{urhfe

hküÙ…rŒ zku™kÕz xÙB…u [e™ …h
y{urhfe zâqxe ðÄkhe™u 145 xfk
fhe ËeÄe nŒe y™u [e™u …ý ƒË÷ku

÷uŒk y{urhfe ykÞkŒ …h 125 xfk

zâqxe ÷„kðe nŒe. ykx÷k Ÿ[k
xurhV™ku yÚko yu Au fu ƒt™u Ëuþku

yufƒeò™k Wí…kË™ku™ku ƒrn»fkh

fhe hÌkk Au, su™k fkhýu ðu…kh
¾kuhðkE hÌkku Au, su „Þk ð»ku o
US$660 rƒr÷Þ™Úke ðÄw nŒku.
y{urhfk y™u [e™™e yk

ònuhkŒ™u fkhýu þuhƒòh{kt WAk¤ku

ykÔÞk u. nk u t„fk u t„™k u nU„ ‚U„

RLzuõ‚ ÷„¼„ ºký xfk ðæÞku.

s{o™e y™u £kL‚™k ƒòhku{kt 0.7

xfk™ku ðÄkhku ÚkÞku.

ykíktfðkËLku «kuíMkknLk yÃkkþu íkku,

rðïLkk Lkfþk{kt ÃkkrfMíkkLk çkhçkkË
Ãkn÷økk{{kt ÚkÞu÷k nw{÷kLkk fkhýu {kºk sB{w-fk~{eh{kt s þktrík

¼tøk LkÚke ÚkR, Mk{økú ¼khík yk ½xLkkÚke ®[íkkøkúMík çkLÞwt, ík{k{
LkkøkrhfLkk {Lk{kt íkýkð ðæÞku. MkkiLke Mkk{u yuf «&™ Q¼ku ÚkÞku. ykÃkýu

fu{ þktík Aeyu? sðkçke fkÞoðkne fu{ fhíkk LkÚke? ykíktfðkËeyku õÞkt

økÞk? Ãk¥kku fu{ ÷køkíkku LkÚke? yk ½xLkk ÃkhÚke ÃkËzku QXâku fu íkhík s

yuf ðkík MÃkü çkLke fu, ykíktfðkËLkku [nuhku nðu çkË÷kÞku Au. Ä{o yLku
Lkk{ ÃkqAeLku økku¤e {khðk{kt ykðe. fuðe Au yk Lkerík?fkuLkk ykËuþÚke
ykðku çkË÷kð ykÔÞku? yk yuf Mkðk÷ níkku y™u Au, ykíktfeykuyu
«ðkMkeykuLkku ½uhkð fÞkuo y™u økku¤e {khe. íku{Lkk yk ¾íkhLkkf ËwMkknMk
ÃkAe ¼khíku íkhík s çkuXf çkku÷kðe y™u ‘ykuÃkhuþLk ®MkËqh’ ytíkøkoík støk
ònuh fhðkLke ½ku»kýk fhe, òu fu, yk ÷zkR ÃkkrfMíkkLk MkiLÞ Mkk{u Lk
níke, yk ÷zkR ykíktfðkË Mkk{u níke, yk støk ¾u÷kÞku ykíktfðkËLkk
¾kík{k {kxu. yk ÷zkR{kt ykíktfeykuLku szçkkíkkuz sðkçk yÃkkÞku.

ykíktfðkËLke rðYæÄ ¼khíkLke yíÞkh MkwÄeLke MkkiÚke rLkýkoÞf y™u
hýLkeríkf fkÞoðkneyku ÃkifeLke yk yuf níke. ‘ykuÃkhuþLk ®MkËqh’Lkk fuð¤
ykíktfe MktøkXLkku y™u yu{Lkk Mk{Úkofku{kt Ÿzku ¼Þ ÃkuËk fÞkuo, Ãkhtíkw ðirïf
{t[ Ãkh ¼khíkLke AçkeLku yuf yuðe þÂõíkLkk YÃk{kt {sçkqík fhe su ÃkkuíkkLke
Mkt«¼wíkk y™u LkkøkrhfkuLke Mkwhûkk {kxu fkuRÃký nË MkwÄe sR þfu Au.
‘ykuÃkhuþLk ®MkËqh’ ykíktfe {k¤¾kLkk {Míkf Ãkh MkeÄku «nkh níkku, yk
ykuÃkhuþLk{kt ÷~fh-yu- íkÞçkk y™u siþ-yu {kun{Ë suðk «{w¾ ykíktfe
MktøkXLkkuLkk XufkýkykuLku rLkþkLk çkLkkðkÞk, ßÞkt ykíktfeyku ¾wÕ÷uyk{
Vhíkk níkk y™u Mkr¢Þ Ãký níke, yøkkWÚke fkÞoðkneyku, su{ fu, MkŠsf÷
MxÙkRf yÚkðk çkk÷kfkux yuh MxÙkRfu ykíktfe LkuxðfoLkk çknkhLkk rnMMkkLku
LkwfMkkLk ÃknkU[kzâwt níkwt, Ãkhtíkw yk ð¾íku ¼khíku ‘MkkÃkLkwt {Míkf fkÃkðk
yÚkðk f[zðk’Lke hýLkerík yÃkLkkðe níke. yk hýLkeríkyu ykíktfeyku

y™u yu{Lkk ÃkkrfMíkkLk Mk{Úkofku{kt Ÿzku {Lkkuði¿kkrLkf ¼Þ ÃkuËk fhe ËeÄku

níkku. ð»ko 2019{kt çkk÷kfkux yuh MxÙkRf ÃkAe A ð»ko MkwÄe {kuxk ykíktfe
nw{÷kLke yLkwÃkÂMÚkrík yu ðkíkLkku Ãkwhkðk Mk{kLk níke fu, ¼khíkLke
fkÞoðkneykuyu ykíktfeykuLkk {Lk{kt zh çkuMkkze ËeÄku níkku. ykuÃkhuþLk

®MkËqhu yk zhLku ðÄw Ÿzku y™u øknLk çkLkkÔÞku Au, íku Ãkwhðkh fhu Au fu,
¼khíkLkk fuð¤ ykíktfe XufkýkykuLku Lkü fhe þfu Au, Ãkhtíkw yu{Lke Ãkwhe
f{ktz Mkth[LkkLku æðMík fhðkLke ûk{íkk Ãký hk¾u Au, yk ykuÃkhuþLkLke
WÕ÷u¾LkeÞ rðþu»kíkk ¼khíkLke çkË÷kÞu÷ hýLkerík níke. ßÞkt çkk÷kfkux{kt

¼khíkeÞ ðkÞwMkuLkkLkk rð{kLkkuyu ÃkkrfMíkkLke Mke{k{kt «ðuþ fÞkuo níkku,
íkku ykuÃkhuþLk ®MkËqh{kt ¼khíku ÃkkuíkkLke Mke{kLke ytËh hneLku MxuLz- ykuV
nrÚkÞkhkuLkku WÃkÞkuøk fÞkuo. yk hýLkeríkf çkË÷kð Lkk fuð¤ ¼khíkLke

xufrLkf÷ ©ucíkk Ëþkoðu Au, Ãkhtíkw yu Ãký MÃkü fhu Au fu, ¼khík ðøkh
yLkkðk~Þf W~fuhkx ÃkkuíkkLkk Ëw&{LkkuLku LkuMíkLkkçkwË Ãký fhe þfu Au. yk
fkÞoðkneyu ÃkkrfMíkkLkLke MkiLÞ y™u {Lkkuði¿kkrLkf Lkçk¤kRykuLku ¾wÕ÷e
Ãkkze ËeÄe. suLkkÚke yu{Lkku ykí{rðïkMk zøk{øke økÞku.

yk hýLkerík ¼khíkLke MkiLÞ Lkerík{kt yuf Lkðk ÞwøkLke þYykík
Au. ßÞkt ykÃkýu sYhík yLkwMkkh ÃkkuíkkLke hýLkeríkykuLku MktþkurÄík y™u
ykÄwrLkf çkLkkðeyu Aeyu. ykuÃkhuþLk ÃkAe ¼khík ÃkkrfMíkkLk Mke{k Ãkh
íkýkð Ëu¾kÞ Au. rMkÍVkÞh ÃkAe WÕ÷t½LkLke fux÷eÞu ½xLkkyku Mkk{u ykðe.

Ãkhtíkw ÃkkrfMíkkLk{kt nðu yux÷e ®n{ík LkÚke hne fu íku fkuR {kuxwt ËwMkknMk
fhe þfu. ¼khíkLke Lkerík yufË{ MÃkü Au òu ÃkkrfMíkkLk þktrík ò¤ðþu íkku

¼khík Ãký þktríkLkwt «{ký «Míkwík fhþu. nk, yu ¾kuxwt Au fu, rMkÍVkÞh{kt
y{urhfkLke fkuR {kuxe ¼qr{fk níke.  {uLkk hkus y{urhfe WÃkhk»xÙÃkríkyu
«ÄkLk{tºke LkhuLÿ {kuËe MkkÚku ðkík fhe níke, yu ÃkAe ÃkkrfMíkkLku ¼khíkeÞ
nðkR {ÚkfkuLku rLkþkLk çkLkkððkLke rLk»V¤ fkurþþ fhe níke. sðkçk{kt

¼khíku ÃkkuíkkLke MkuLkkykuLku ¾wÕ÷e Aqx ykÃke ËeÄe, suÚke íkuLkk Ãkrhýk{
MðYÃk ÃkkrfMíkkLkLkk ykX nðkR Xufkýkyku Ãkh nw{÷k fhðk{kt ykÔÞk.
yk nw{÷kykuyu ÃkkrfMíkkLk{kt íkýkð y™u zhLkku {knku÷ Q¼ku fhe ËeÄku
níkku.

{™u {kºk hksfw{kh™e …í™e
Œhefu yku¤¾kðwt ™ne „{u
yr¼™uºke …ºk÷u¾k nk÷{kt s rVÕ{ ‘Vq÷u’{kt òuðk {¤e nŒe. yk{kt,

Œu™u Œu™k þk™Ëkh yr¼™Þ {kxu ½ýe «þt‚k {¤e. yr¼™uºkeyu nðu

¾w÷k‚ku fÞkou Au fu yuf ‚khe f÷kfkh nkuðk AŒkt, Œu™u fk{ {kxu ‚t½»ko fhðku
…zu Au. Œuýeyu yuf RLxhÔÞw{kt fÌkwt nŒwt fu Œuýe™u hksfw{kh™e …Je fnuðk™wt
…‚tË ™Úke. Œu{™wt yt„Œ Sð™ Œu{™k ÔÞkð‚krÞf Sð™™u y‚h fhu
Au.…ºk÷u¾kyu fÌkwt, ‘{™u hksfw{kh hkð™e …Je fnuðk™wt ¾hu¾h ¾hkƒ
÷k„u Au. {™u Œu „{Œwt ™Úke. y™u nwt ¾qƒ ™k™e nkuðk™ku y™w¼ð fhwt Awt.
fkhý fu {khwt yuf ™k{ Au, {khwt yuf yrMŒíð Au. yr¼™uºkeyu fÌkwt fu ÷kufku
{k™u Au fu hksfw{kh ‚kÚku Œu™k ‚tƒtÄ nkuðkÚke Œu™u ‚t½»ko fhðku …zâku ™
nkuŒ. ‘fkhý fu Œ{™u ÷k„u Au fu {khwt Sð™ ‚h¤ nþu fkhý fu {khk
…rŒ... yÚkðk {khku Œu ‚{Þ™ku ƒkuÞ¤uLz fu su ¾qƒ «ÏÞkŒ nŒku.’ …htŒw òu
Œ{u …kuŒk™wt ™k{ ƒ™kððk™ku «Þk‚ fhe hÌkk Aku, Œku Œ{khku …kuŒk™ku
fkhrfËeo „úkV ƒ™kððku õÞkhuÞ ‚h¤ ™Úke. Œu ¾qƒ s {w~fu÷ Au.yr¼™uºke
…ºk÷u¾kyu {erzÞk™u rð™tŒe fhe fu Œuyku Œu{™u VõŒ yuf s xu„ ‚wÄe
{ÞkorËŒ ™ hk¾u, ‘nwt yk{kt õÞkhuÞ ykhk{ËkÞf ™nª hneþ.’ nwt ytŒ
‚wÄe yk {kxu {khku yðks WXkðeþ. ÷kufku „{u íÞkhu hks ‚kÚku ðkŒ fhðk
{khe …k‚u ykðu Au. Œuyku {khe …k‚u rM¢Ãx ÷E™u ykðu Au, yux÷k {kxu
™nª fu Œuyku {™u fkMx fhðk {kt„u Au, …ý yux÷k {kxu fu Œuyku {™u fkMx
fhðk {kt„u Au. Œuyku RåAu Au fu nwt Œu™u hks …k‚u ÷E òô, ßÞkhu rVÕ{
{khe Au.…ºk÷u¾kyu ¾w÷k‚ku fÞkou fu ykðe nhfŒku AŒkt, Œuýeyu hksfw{kh
hkð™u ¾kuxk RhkËk ‚kÚku ykðŒk «kusuõxT‚{kt ‚k{u÷ fhðk™ku R™fkh fÞkou
nŒku. Œuýu fÌkwt, ‘yk {khk „kihð™e rðhwØ Au.’

ƒku÷eðwz{kt Œku ™ne s ykðwt: ‚khk ŒUzw÷fh
‚r[™ ŒUzw÷fh™e …wºke ‚khk ŒUzw÷fh ‚kurþÞ÷ {erzÞk …h ÷kufr«Þ

hnu Au. ‚khk Ëhhkus ftEf ™u ftEf þuh fhŒe hnu Au. …htŒw Œuýu ƒkur÷ðqz{kt
zuçÞq fhðk™ku R™fkh fhe ËeÄku Au.‚r[™ ŒUzw÷fh™e …wºke ‚khk ŒUzw÷fh
nt{uþk nuz÷kRL‚{kt hnu Au. Œu ‚kurþÞ÷ {erzÞk …h ‚r¢Þ hnu Au y™u

Ëhhkus Œu™k Vkuxk þuh fhŒe hnu Au.Ëhhkus Œu™wt ™k{ fkuE™u fkuE ‚kÚku
òuzkE hÌkwt Au.AuÕ÷k fux÷kf rËð‚kuÚke ‚khk™wt ™k{ yr¼™uŒk r‚ØktŒ
[ŒwðouËe ‚kÚku òuzkE hÌkwt Au. òufu ƒt™uyu yk yt„u {ki™ Äkhý fÞowt Au.‚khk™k
ƒkur÷ðqz zuçÞq™k ‚{k[kh ½ýk ‚{ÞÚke ykðe hÌkk Au. òufu ‚khk yk rðþu
ftE fne hne ™ nŒe. nðu yuf RLxhÔÞw{kt ‚khkyu M…ü fÞowt Au fu Œu
ƒkur÷ðqz{kt zuçÞq fhðk™e ™Úke.‚khkyu yuf RLxhÔÞw{kt fÌkwt - nwt ½ýe ƒÄe
ðMŒwyku fhwt Awt. {khku …kÞku, nwt Œu™k …h …qýo ‚{Þ æÞk™ furLÿŒ fhwt Awt. yk
W…hktŒ, nwt Vuþ™, ‚wtËhŒk y™u Sð™þi÷e™k ûkuºk{kt …ý fk{ fhwt Awt. {™u
su ÞkuøÞ ÷k„u Œu fhðk™ku «Þk‚ fhwt Awt. nwt Ëhuf ðkŒ™u nk ™Úke fnuŒe . {™u
yr¼™Þ{kt rƒ÷fw÷ h‚ ™Úke. nwt ytŒ{ow¾e ÔÞrõŒ Awt. {™u fu{uhkÚke zh
÷k„u Au.‚khkyu fÌkwt- {™u yíÞkh ‚wÄe ½ýe rVÕ{ku™e ykuVh {¤e Au. {U
ƒÄk™u ™k …kze ËeÄe Au.

íktºke©eLke f÷{u

rðhkx-hkurnŒ 2027™ku ODI ðÕzo f… ™nª h{e þfu
Lkðe rËÕne,  rðhkx fkun÷e y™u

hkurnŒ þ{ko AuÕ÷e ð¾Œ $ø÷uLz
«ðk‚ …h ¼khŒ {kxu xuMx h{Œk
òuðk {éÞk nkuŒ, …htŒw ©uýe þY
ÚkkÞ Œu …nu÷kt s Œu{™k xuMx Vku{uox
Ak uzðk™k ‚{k[khu ƒÄk™u
ykùÞo[rfŒ fhe ËeÄk. Œu{ýu T20

yktŒhhküÙeÞ r¢fux{ktÚke …ý r™ð]r¥k
÷E ÷eÄe Au. ŒuÚke Œuyku VõŒ

ð™zu{kt s ¼khŒ {kxu h{Œk òuðk
{¤þu.  rðhkx fkun÷eyu 2027™k
ðÕzo f…{kt h{ðk™e RåAk ÔÞõŒ
fhe Au. hkurnŒ 50 ykuðh™k ðÕzo
f…™u …ý ½ýwt {níð yk…u Au,
…h tŒ w  ‚ w™e÷ „kðMfh™ u  ™Úke
÷k„Œw t fu hk urnŒ y™u rðhkx™w t
2027™k ðÕzo f…{k t h{ðk™w t
Mð¡ …qÁt Úkþu. yuf ELxhÔÞw{kt

„kðMfhu fÌkwt fu 2027 ðÕzo f…{kt
Œ u{™ w t  h{ð w t  f u  ™nª Œ u
…‚tË„efkhku™k {tŒÔÞ …h r™¼oh
hnuþu. …‚tË„efkhku òuþu fu Œuyku
fuðwt «Ëþo™ fhu Au. „kðMfhu fÌkwt-
Œ u{ýu yk Vk u{ u ox{k t ¾qƒ ‚kÁt
«Ëþo™ fÞwO Au. …htŒw …‚tË„efkhku
2027 ðÕz o  f…™ u  æÞk™{k t
h k ¾ þ u .

y{ËkðkË {tz¤u {w‚kVhku™e ‚wrðÄk
{kxu fÞko rðr¼Òk ‚hkn™eÞ «Þk‚ku

y{ËkðkË, …rù{ huÕðu™k
y{ËkðkË {tz¤ îkhk ŒksuŒh{kt

{w‚kVhku™e ‚wrðÄk y™u ‚whrûkŒ
{w‚kVhe ‚wr™rùŒ fhðk {kxu
rðr¼Òk ‚{Þ‚h y™u «þt‚™eÞ

…„÷kt ÷eÄkt Au. su™wt ‚trûkó ðýo™
™e[u {wsƒ Au: Œkhe¾
09.05.2025 ™k hkus, xÙu™ ‚tÏÞk
15668 fk{kÏÞk-„ktÄeÄk{

yuõ‚«u‚ ™u Œu™k r™ÄkorhŒ {k„o

rðh{„k{-‚whuLÿ™„h-ðktfk™uh-
{kuhƒe-„ktÄeÄk{™u ƒË÷u

yku…huþ™÷ fkhýku‚h ðifÂÕ…f {k„o

rðh{„k{-Äúk t„Äúk-‚k{kÏÞk÷e-

„ktÄeÄk{ îkhk [÷kððk{kt ykðe

nŒe. yk VuhVkh ™e òýfkhe nuŒw
{w‚kVhku™u y„kWÚke ‚tËuþkyku
{kuf÷ðk{kt ykÔÞk nŒk y™u ðktfk™uh

y™u {kuhƒe Mxuþ™ku …h …ý xÙu™ ™k
{k„o …rhðŒo™™e ònuhkŒ fhðk{kt

ykðe nŒe. yk W…hktŒ, hu÷ «‚k‚™
îkhk Äúkt„Äúk Mxuþ™ …h GSRTC

(„wshkŒ hkßÞ {k„o …rhðn™
r™„{) ™k ‚nÞku„Úke  ƒu ƒ‚ku™e

ÔÞðMÚkk fhðk{kt ykðe nŒe, su™k
îkhk ÷„¼„ 80 {w‚kVhku™u Œu{™k
„tŒÔÞ MÚkk™ …h ‚whrûkŒ y™u
‚h¤ŒkÚke …nkut[kzðk{kt ykÔÞk nŒk.

W™k¤k™k ðufuþ™ Ëhr{Þk™ Mxuþ™ku

…h y…urûkŒ ¼ez™u æÞk™{kt hk¾e™u,
y{ËkðkË {tz¤  îkhk ™e[u {wsƒ
™k ™¬h …„÷kt ÷uðk{kt ykÔÞk Au:

ðÄkhk™k rxrfx fkWLxh™e òu„ðkE,
{w‚kVhku {kxu ‚wr™ÞkursŒ fŒkh
ÔÞðMÚkk, ‚foTÞw÷u®x„ y™u nkuÂÕzt„ ûkuºk
™e ÔÞðMÚkk, ðÄkhk™k huÕðu MxkV™e
Œi™kŒe, r™Þr{Œ ònuhkŒku îkhk
{krnŒe …qhe …kzðe.

yk W…hktŒ, ¼khu „h{e
Ëhr{Þk™ {w‚kVhku™u hknŒ yk…ðk
{kxu, y{ËkðkË {tz¤ ™k y{ËkðkË,
‚kƒh{Œe, y‚khðk,
{rý™„h,ðxðk ‚rnŒ rðr¼Òk
Mxuþ™ku …h rƒ™-‚hfkhe ‚tMÚkkyku

(yu™Syku) y™u
zeykhÞw‚e‚e(rzrðÍ™÷ hu÷ ÞwÍ‚o
fL‚Õxurxð fr{xe) ‚kÚku ‚tf÷™
fhe™u ðÄkhk™k …eðk™k …kýe™e

{VŒ ÔÞðMÚkk fhðk{kt ykðe Au.

y{ËkðkË {tz¤ hu÷ «þk‚™

{w‚kVhku™e ‚wrðÄk y™u ‚whûkk {kxu
‚ŒŒ «Þk‚hŒ Au.

Þwxâwƒh yuÂÕðþ ÞkËð™u nkEfkuxo™ku Íxfku
yÕ÷knkƒkË,

yÕ÷knkƒkË nkEfk ux u o

Þwxâwƒh yuÂÕðþ ÞkËð™u {kuxk u
Íxfk u  ykÃÞk u  A u. ðkMŒð{k t

yÕ÷knkƒkË nkEfk ux u o  yuÂÕðþ

ÞkËð™e yhS V„kðe ËeÄe Au.

yuÂÕðþu ™kuEzk{kt huð …kxeo{kt zÙø‚
y™u ‚k…™k Íuh ‚kÚk u ‚tƒtrÄŒ

fu‚{kt yhS Ëk¾÷ fhe nŒe.

yhS{kt yuÂÕðþu fkuxo™u …kuŒk™e

‚k{u Ëk¾÷ fhkÞu÷ [ksoþex y™u

‚{L‚ hË fhðk™e {k„ fhe nŒe.

sÂMx‚ ‚kih¼ ©eðkMŒð™e ƒuL[u

yuÂÕðþ ÞkËð™e yhS V„kðe

ËeÄe Au, ƒuL[u fÌkwt fu, FIR y™u
[ksoþex ƒt™ u{k t  Œ u™e rðÁØ

r™ðuË™ku ™kutÄkÞu÷k Au. LÞkÞkÄeþu

fÌk w t  f u, f u‚ Ëhr{Þk™ yk
ykhk u…k u™e ‚íÞŒk™e Œ…k‚

fhðk{kt ykðþu. fkuxuo yu{ …ý fÌkwt
fu, yuÂÕðþu …kuŒk™e yhS{kt FIR
™u s …zfkhe ™Úke. yuÂÕðþ™k

ðrhc ðfe÷ ™ðe™ r‚Lnkyu ðfe÷

r™…wý ®‚n y™u ðfe÷ ™{™
y„úðk÷ ‚kÚku {¤e™u Ë÷e÷ fhe fu,
F IR Ëk¾÷ fh™kh ÔÞÂõŒ

ðLÞSð™ ‚thûký fkÞËk nuX¤

fkÞËu‚h heŒu yrÄf]Œ ™Úke. yu …ý
Ë÷e÷ fhe nŒe fu ßÞkt frÚkŒ ½x™k

ƒ™e nŒe Œu …kxeo{kt yuÂÕðþ ÞkËð

nksh ™nkuŒku. yk ‚kÚku s ðfe÷kuyu

fÌkwt fu, yuÂÕðþ …k‚uÚke fkuE ‚k…™wt
Íuh fu zÙø‚ ™nkuŒwt {éÞwt.

ƒeS ŒhV rð…ûk™k ðfe÷

{™e»k „k uÞ÷u Ë÷e÷ fhe f u,
Œ…k‚{kt òýðk {éÞwt Au fu yuÂÕðþu
yu ÔÞÂõŒyku™u ‚k… M…÷kÞ fhŒku

nŒku, su{™e …k‚uÚke ‚k…™wt Íuh

{¤e ykÔÞwt nŒwt. òufu, ƒt™u …ûkku™u
‚kt¼éÞk ƒkË nkEfkuxuo yuÂÕðþ™e

yhS V„kðe ËeÄe y™u fÌkwt fu yk
{k{÷u xÙkÞ÷ fkuxuo r™ýoÞ ÷uðk™ku
Au. Œ{™u sýkðe ËEyu fu, 3
™ðuBƒh, 2023™k hkus ™kuEzk™k

‚uõxh 49{kt Þwxâwƒh yuÂÕðþ
ÞkËð ‚rnŒ ½ýk ÷kufku rðÁØ FIR

™ku tÄðk{kt ykðe nŒe. …eyuVyu

yku„uo™kEÍuþ™™k yur™{÷ ðu÷Vuh

ykurV‚h „kihð „wókyu yk Œ{k{
‚k{u FIR ™kutÄkðe nŒe.


